

Commercial Printing - Envelopes, Forms 2022-23-14

2022-23-14 Commercial Printing - Forms and Envelopes
 Yellow- Lowest Bid Blue - Lowest/Item Awarded

ITEM	Quantity	Print Plus/Bufalo Publishing Corp	Concept Print	Zenger Group	Orffeo Printing	RMF Printing	G&M Enterprises	Data-Mation Printing and Graphics
#10 Regular Envelope	500	88.35	97.00	121.00	38.00	85.22	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	111.37	105.00	137.00	57.00	98.15	No Bid	No Bid
	1,500	137.37	122.00	153.00	63.00	118.38	No Bid	No Bid
	2,000	161.50	147.00	171.00	83.00	132.80	No Bid	No Bid
	2,500	187.84	178.00	191.00	92.00	154.88	No Bid	No Bid
	3,000	213.48	218.00	309.00	120.00	173.55	No Bid	No Bid
	4,000	264.96	259.00	247.00	142.00	222.04	No Bid	No Bid
	5,000	314.76	289.00	285.00	179.00	251.25	No Bid	No Bid
	25,000	1,282.12	1,235.00	1,035.00	736.00	934.50	No Bid	No Bid
#10 Window Envelope	500	91.50	99.00	104.00	42.00	97.05	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	117.52	111.00	139.00	67.00	103.48	No Bid	No Bid
	2,000	173.41	159.00	205.00	92.00	132.04	No Bid	No Bid
#10 Security Envelope	500	No Bid	98.00	110.00	85.00	103.48	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	125.00	150.00	98.00	115.18	No Bid	No Bid
#10 Window Security Envelope	500	No Bid	103.00	127.00	85.00	103.48	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	131.00	148.00	98.00	115.18	No Bid	No Bid
	2,500	No Bid	219.00	168.00	220.00	173.88	No Bid	No Bid
	5,000	No Bid	389.00	216.00	433.00	277.55	No Bid	No Bid
	7,500	No Bid	569.00	432.00	658.00	376.88	No Bid	No Bid
	25,000	No Bid	1,625.00	1,268.00	1,646.00	835.50	No Bid	No Bid
	Reverse flap - 25,000	No Bid	1,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	1,124.50	No Bid	No Bid
#10 Regular Postage Paid Envelope	2,500	No Bid	178.00	229.00	1,860.00	178.28	No Bid	No Bid
Progress Report Envelope	500	No Bid	156.00	397.00	96.00	185.12	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	263.00	511.00	147.00	387.79	No Bid	No Bid
	1,500	No Bid	364.00	625.00	189.00	459.72	No Bid	No Bid
Corridor Pass Pads	500	No Bid	798.00	424.00	196.00	475.54	No Bid	No Bid
Field Trip Form	500	No Bid	131.00	241.00	92.00	124.54	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	189.00	387.00	142.00	198.25	No Bid	No Bid
Fundraising Request Form	500	No Bid	131.00	172.00	92.00	124.54	No Bid	No Bid
Payroll Adjustment Form (substitute)	5,000	No Bid	326.00	320.00	235.00	514.15	No Bid	No Bid
	10,000	No Bid	605.00	412.00	430.00	906.10	No Bid	No Bid
Payroll Adjustment Form (not normal hours) - Trans. Dept. 5,000		No Bid	326.00	320.00	235.00	514.50	No Bid	No Bid

Commercial Printing - Envelopes, Forms 2022-23-14

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Print Plus/Bufalo Publishing Corp</u>	<u>Concept Print</u>	<u>Zenger Group</u>	<u>Orffeo Printing</u>	<u>RMF Printing</u>	<u>G&M Enterprises</u>	<u>Data-Mation Printing and Graphics</u>
	10,000	No Bid	605.00	439.00	430.00	906.10	No Bid	No Bid
Request for College Application Processing Form	1,000	No Bid	131.00	283.00	84.00	128.05	No Bid	No Bid
Request for Transcript Form	1,000	No Bid	131.00	283.00	93.00	128.05	No Bid	No Bid
Student Deposit Reconciliation Form	500	No Bid	119.00	184.00	78.00	103.48	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	162.00	283.00	118.00	155.68	No Bid	No Bid
Student Activity Pay Order Form	500	No Bid	97.00	141.00	45.00	51.68	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	136.00	191.00	66.00	77.74	No Bid	No Bid
Student Activity Transfer Order Form	100	No Bid	109.00	105.00	38.00	38.55	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher Personal Leave Request Form	500	No Bid	314.00	157.00	149.00	129.74	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	498.00	229.00	192.00	244.95	No Bid	No Bid
Sweet Home Middle School Report Card Paper	1,500	259.69	159.00	249.00	105.00	240.37	No Bid	No Bid
Sweet Home High School Report Card Paper	1,500	259.69	159.00	249.00	105.00	240.37	No Bid	No Bid
Exam Booklet Paper	5,000	383.56	1,019.00	687.00	325.00	494.85	No Bid	No Bid
Buildings & Grounds Time Cards	500	No Bid	97.00	130.00	36.00	44.98	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	No Bid	118.00	139.00	52.00	64.87	No Bid	No Bid
	2,000	No Bid	142.00	173.00	75.00	97.05	No Bid	No Bid
Hourly Employee Time Cards	500	No Bid	110.00	132.00	42.00	55.51	No Bid	No Bid
Administrative Note Cards & Envelopes	100	No Bid	No Bid	203.00	No Bid	208.78	No Bid	No Bid
	200	No Bid	No Bid	243.00	No Bid	257.92	No Bid	No Bid
	500	No Bid	No Bid	362.00	No Bid	357.37	No Bid	No Bid
Brochures (blue ink on ivory paper)	500	130.00	131.00	258.00	110.00	162.11	No Bid	No Bid
	1,000	140.00	157.00	330.00	130.00	238.88	No Bid	No Bid
	2,500	204.00	235.00	509.00	215.00	441.61	No Bid	No Bid
Pocket Folders	1,000	No Bid	961.00	1,314.00	960.00	1,280.50	No Bid	No Bid
	1,500	No Bid	1,249.00	1,567.00	1,100.00	1,619.22	No Bid	No Bid
Budget Postcards	10,000	264.36	No Bid	692.00	276.00	591.27	No Bid	No Bid
Mail Prep of Budget Postcards	9,900	169.00	No Bid	441.00	190.00	312.00	No Bid	No Bid

Commercial Printing - Envelopes, Forms 2022-23-14

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Print Plus/Buffalo Publishing Corp</u>	<u>Concept Print</u>	<u>Zenger Group</u>	<u>Orffeo Printing</u>	<u>RMF Printing</u>	<u>G&M Enterprises</u>	<u>Data-Mation Printing and Graphics</u>
Megan's Law Mailers	10,000	340.00	No Bid	823.00	355.00	647.53	No Bid	No Bid
Mail Prep for Megan's Law Mailers	9,900	249.00	No Bid	484.00	270.00	312.00	No Bid	No Bid
Parent University Brochure	2,500	660.00	No Bid	572.00	220.00	288.86	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Bid	4,244.83	10,329.00	12,392.00	8,134.00	12,025.78	-	-
	# of Items Bid	11	24	29	28	30	0	0
	Total Awarded	1,226.36	178.00	412.00	4,538.00	1,481.87	-	-
	# of Items Awarded	5	1	1	21	2	0	0
		Grand total awarded		7,836.23				