

Calendar Bid - 2022-23-13
7/1/22 - 6/30/23

Lowest Price

Vendor	Design	Printing/Cutting Option 1	Printing/Cutting Option 2	Mail Cost	Total Bid Amount Option 1	Total Bid Amount Option 2
BNP Empowered Print	924.00	5,914.00	6,333.00	514.00	7,352.00	7,771.00
Compu-Mail	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Courier Printing Corporation	1,100.00	7,613.00	8,060.00	799.00	9,512.00	9,959.00
DataMation Printing & Graphics	600.00	9,863.00	10,224.00	600.00	11,063.00	11,424.00
G&M Enterprises	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Orffeo Printing & Imaging Inc.	450.00	6,168.00	6,516.00	430.00	7,048.00	7,396.00
RMF Mgmt Group	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
School Paper Exress	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*Alternate Size

Price subject to change*

This bid is awarded to Orffeo Printing.