

Commercial Print - Newsletter Community Education Brochures 2022-23-15

Vendor	One 12 Page Newsletter	Two 20 Page Newsletters	One 36 Page Combined Newsletter	Two 40 Page Combined Newsletter	Total Cost of Design	Mail Preparation for 6 Publications	Printing & Cutting	Four Page Signature Comm Ed	Eight Page Signature Comm Ed	Cost per Author Alternation
BNP Empowered Print *	1,239.00	3,384.00	2,645.00	6,214.00	3,696.00	2,516.00	19,694.00	350.00	600.00	55/hr
Compu-Mail	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Courier Printing	2,001.00	5,998.00	5,084.00	11,066.00	4,200.00	1,020.00	29,369.00	749.00	1,307.00	25.00
Data-Mation Printing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
G&M Enterprises	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Orffeo Printing	1,373.00	4,783.00	3,870.00	7,930.00	2,414.00	1,906.00	22,276.00	1,080.00	1,788.00	65.00
RMF Print Mgmt Group	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
School Paper Express	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

This bid has been awarded to Orffeo Printing

*Alternate bid submitted